

BID RESULTS	ORGANIZATION:			
BID #	BID 4-2020 RAW WATER TRANSMISSION LINE	SUSSEX BORO		
BID DATE/ TIME	1/21/2020 9:00 A.M.			
NUMBER OF BIDDERS	9			
NAME OF BIDDER	J. D'Annunzio & Sons Inc	Montana Construction	TAM Enterprises Inc.	PLC Group
ADDRESS	3730 Park Ave	80 Contant Avenue	114 Hartley Road	PO Box 221
CITY, STATE, ZIP	South Plainfield, New Jersey, 07080	Lodi, New Jersey, 07644	Goshen, New York, 10924	New Milford, New York, 10959
CONTACT				
TELEPHONE	732-574-1300	9734785200	845-294-8882	2014810488
EMAIL	<a href="mailto:rmanning@dannunziocorp.com">rmanning@dannunziocorp.com</a>	<a href="mailto:jkenny@montanaconstructioninc.com">jkenny@montanaconstructioninc.com</a>	<a href="mailto:bcutler@tamentinc.com">bcutler@tamentinc.com</a>	<a href="mailto:jdesofte@lonestarplc.com">jdesofte@lonestarplc.com</a>
Proposal Guarantee or Bid Bond	x	x	x	NO BID BOND PHYSICAL AT BORO
Consent of Surety	x	x	x	
Ownership Disclosure	x	x	x	x
List of All Subcontractors (Sub Contractor Utilization form)	x	x	x	x
Addenda Acknowledgement	x	x	x	N
NJDCA Small Cities CDBG Program Compliance Checklist	x	x	x	N
Proposal Form	x	x	x	un readable
Experience & Qualifications	x	x	x	N - unsigned and not fully filled out
Non Collusion Affidavit	x	x	x	N
Compliance Statement Form RD 400-6	x	x	N	N
Business Reg	x	x	x	N
Affirmative Action Compliance Notice	x	x	x	x
Mandatory EEO Language	x	x	x	x
Americans with Disabilities	x	x	x	x
Public Works Contractor Registration	x	x	x	N
Iran Disclosure	x	x	x	x
List of Proposed Supplier	x	x	x	x
List of Project References	x	x	x	
Equipment Certification	x	x	N	
Debarment Certification federal	x	x	N	N
Proof of Sams Registration	x	x	x	N
	1	2	3	4
	J. D'Annunzio & Sons Inc	Montana Construction	TAM Enterprises Inc.	PLC Group
BASE BID (page 63)	\$2,327,000.00	\$3,051,111.00	\$3,182,000.00	\$3,211,000.00
ALTERNATE # 1	\$2,100,000.00	\$425,110.00	no bid	\$404,087.00
ALTERNATE # 2	\$900,000.00	\$725,000.00	no bid	no bid
TOTAL BASE AND ALTERNATES	\$5,327,000.00	\$4,201,221.00	\$3,182,000.00	\$3,615,087.00
SUB CONTRACTOR				
Name	HBC Company	High Point Electrical	Boz Electrical Contractors	
BRC				
PWCRA				
Other	Electrical	Electrical	Electrical	
Name		AGS Plumbing & Mechanical	SREC Resources	
BRC				
PWCRA				

BID RESULTS					
BID #					
BID DATE/ TIME					
NUMBER OF BIDDERS					
<b>NAME OF BIDDER</b>	Underground Utilities Corp	Ferraro	Northeast	Pact Two LLC	Bond Civil & Utility Construction, Inc
<b>ADDRESS</b>	711 Commerce Road	5 Park Drive	1433 Route 34 South , B-1	554 Route 31 N, PO Box 74	10 Cabot Road, Suite 300
<b>CITY, STATE, ZIP</b>	Linden, New Jersey, 07036	Franklin, New Jersey, 07416	Farmingdale, New Jersey, 07727	Ringoes, New Jersey, 08551-0074	Medford, Massachusetts, 02155
<b>CONTACT</b>					
<b>TELEPHONE</b>	9088628936	973-827-0947	732-557-6100 ext. 0200	9087881985	6173873400
<b>EMAIL</b>	<a href="mailto:amofa@undergroundutilitiescorp.com">amofa@undergroundutilitiescorp.com</a>	<a href="mailto:laura@ferraroconstruction.com">laura@ferraroconstruction.com</a>	<a href="mailto:ccharcalla@northeastremsco.com">ccharcalla@northeastremsco.com</a>	<a href="mailto:theresa@pactconstruction.com">theresa@pactconstruction.com</a>	<a href="mailto:civilbid@bondbrothers.com">civilbid@bondbrothers.com</a>
<b>Proposal Guarantee or Bid Bond</b>	x	<b>NO BID BOND PHYSICAL AT BORO</b>	x	<b>NO BID BOND PHYSICAL AT BORO</b>	
<b>Consent of Surety</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Ownership Disclosure</b>	x	x	x		
<b>List of All Subcontractors (Sub Contractor Utilization form)</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Addenda Acknowledgement</b>	x	x	x		
<b>NJCA Small Cities CDBG Program Compliance Checklist</b>	N	x	x		
<b>Proposal Form</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Experience &amp; Qualifications</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Non Collusion Affidavit</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Compliance Statement Form RD 400-6</b>	N	x			
<b>Business Reg</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Affirmative Action Compliance Notice</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Mandatory EEO Language</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Americans with Disabilities</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Public Works Contractor Registration</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Iran Disclosure</b>	x	x	x		
<b>List of Proposed Supplier</b>	x	x	x		
<b>List of Project References</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Equipment Certification</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Debarment Certification federal</b>	x	x	x		
<b>Proof of Sams Registration</b>	x	x	x		
	5	6	7	8	9
	<b>Underground Utilities Corp</b>	<b>Ferraro</b>	<b>Northeast</b>	<b>Pact Two LLC</b>	<b>Bond Civil &amp; Utility Construction, Inc</b>
<b>BASE BID (page 63)</b>	<b>\$3,544,421.00</b>	<b>\$3,712,833.00</b>	<b>\$3,955,507.00</b>	<b>\$5,277,300.00</b>	<b>\$7,069,360.00</b>
ALTERNATE # 1	no bid	no bid	\$250.00	\$1,400,000.00	no bid
ALTERNATE # 2	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$1,350,000.00	no bid
TOTAL BASE AND ALTERNATES	\$3,544,421.00	\$3,712,833.00	\$3,955,757.00	\$8,027,300.00	\$7,069,360.00
<b>SUB CONTRACTOR</b>					
Name	William Lubeck Inc.	High Point Electric	Beach Electric		
BRC					
PWCRA					
Other	Electrical	Electric			
Name					
BRC					
PWCRA					

Other		Plumbing	Wiring of wastecorp Equip	
-------	--	----------	---------------------------	--

Other					
-------	--	--	--	--	--